
NAVARROCOUNTY

BID NO. 2022-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

BM Logistics

508 N Kerr

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

903-875-9228

Havoc Transportation

P.O. Box 57

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

Jason Drain/Owner

903-257-5365

Tommy Montgomery

Sand & Gravel

1000 FM 667

Purdon, TX 76679

Tommy Montgomery

903-875-8194

Vendor Material Hauling Rate per Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct
- - Plant Location Pctl Pctl Pctl

Arnold Crushed Stone-Blum TX

1676 NCR 1104 LP

Flex Base, Torpedo Rock, Fines, #57

Rock, 3x5 Oversize,-4 x 8 Gabion,

8x12 RipRao & larger.

S12.00 $11.80 $11.95

i

Big City Crushed Concrete - Dallas, TX

11143 Goodnight Lane

Crushed Concrete 247 FlexBase, D

Grade 1-2, Crushed Asphalt
$13:10 $13.00 $16.75

1

Cleveland Asphalt Products Inc. - Shepherd,

TX

100 Asphalt Lane

Cationic Emulsion $40.00 $40.00 NO BID

1

Conners Crushed Stone - Groesbeck, TX
(Hpnest Ridge)
862 CR 374

Flex Base, 3/4 Minus, 1" Dry
Screened, 1x3 rock, 3x5 rock, 1"

Base

$8.45 $8.48 $8.75

1

Conners Crushed Stone - Clifton, TX

(Greenewade Quarry)

173 CR 1090

Flex Base, 3x5 rock $12.00 $11.80 $11.95

1

Helmcamp Materials, LTD - Groesbeck, TX

(Christmas Quarry)

478 CR 374

2" Flex Base, Flex Base, 1x3,3x5,

and Larger
$8.50 $8.48 $8.75

'

Knife River - Bryan, TX

6310 Hwy 21 West

Riant Mixed Asphalt -Hot Mix, Hot

Mix Cold Laid, Flex Base
$40.00 $40.00 - NO BID

I

Knife River- Waco, TX <

3423 Marlin Hwy 6

Plant Mixed Asphalt -Hot Mix, Hot'

Mix Cold Laid
$13.00 $13.00 $11.95

t

Knife River - Groesbeck, TX

(Sky High Quarry)

3812 FM 1633 West

Flex Base, RipRap 1x3,3x5,4x8 &

larger
$8.50 $8.48 $8.75

1

Martin Marietta - Corsicana, TX

5100 S. HWY 287

Flex Base, Type C, Type D, Dirty

Rock 1",
$6.10 ' $6.50 57.50



NAVARRO COUNTY

BID NO. 2022-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR.HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

Vendor Material Hauling Rate per Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct
Plant Location Pctl Pctl Pctl

Mine Services - Waco, TX

1953 Tom Ledbetter Rd

Nontested Flex Base, C Rock 3/4"

Nontested, D/F Blend 3/8"-l/2"

Non Tested, 3/8 Pea Gravel,

Torpedo Rock

$12.90 $12.20 $il.95

1

Rattler Rock ̂  Blum, TX

110 NCR 1104 LP

Flexbase, 3" - S"Screened Rock, 1"-

3" screened,rock, Non tested Blue

Base

$12.00- $11.80 $11.95

Sustainable Pavement - Dallas, TX

11143 Goodnight Lane

Green Oil Sand,' Super RAM(Asphalt

Millings), Type D Green Cold Mix,

ReCap(Htgh Performance Cold

Patch).

$13.10 $14.00 $16.75

1

Texas Bit - Malakoff Plant

10615 CR Rd 1220
Hot Oil Sand, Hox Mix, Cold Mix^ $8.90 $9.00 $11.75

I

WallerCounty Asphalt-HempsteadTX

22010 Fairgrounds Rd.

ASPPM GRIV High Performance,

Bagged Material, ASPPM GR IV

High Performance Cold Mix-9202

Asphaltic Concrete Patching

Material

$40.00 ■  $40.00 " NO BID

BIDS AWARDED TO THE CHEAPEST OR BEST

» OF TRUCKS MIN/MAX- ttOFTRUCKS - MIN/MAX- # OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX-

OIY/TON/TRUCK. ; - QTY/TONARUCK QTYAON/TRUCK

"UNLIMfTED ■ UNLIMITED' UNLIMITED

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS . - ADDITIONAL COMMENTS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

DEUVERYTIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY: NONE

MAX DELIVERY: NONE

UMITAIJONS ON pEUVERY: NONE

DEUVERYTIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY:-NONE

MAXDEUVERY; NONE

UMITATIONS ON DEUVERY: NONE

DELIVERYTIME: ANY

MIN DEUVERY: 12 TONS

MAXDEUVERY: 26TONS

UMITATIONS NOT SPECIFIED

PCT1-S6.00 PER TON

per 1-$85.00 PER HR

PCT1-.18 LOADED Mile

PCTl-$75.00 HR

PCT1 - $6.00 TON {BARN TO JOB)

PCT1 - .18 PER LOADED TON MILE RATE

PRECINCT 1 - $100.00 PER HR



NAVARRO COUNTY
BID NO. 2022-H-0P5 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

BM Logistics

508NKerr

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

903-875-9228

Havoc T ransportation

P.O. Box 57

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

Jason Drain/Owner

903-257-5365

Tommy Montgomery

Sand & Gravel

1000 FM 667

Purdon,TX 76679

Tommy Montgomery

903-875-8194

Vendor Material Hauling Rateper Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct
Plant Location Pet 2 • Pct2 Pet 2

Arnold Crushed Stone-Blum TX

1676 HGR1104 LP

Flex Base, Torpedo Rock, Fines, #57

Rock, 3x5 Oversize, 4x8 Gabion,

8x12 RipRao & larger,

$13.90 - NO BID $13.80 ,

i

Big City Crushed Concrete - Dallas, TX

11143 Goodnight Lane

Crushed Concrete 247 FlexBase, D

Grade 1-2, Crushed Asphalt
,  $14.55 NO BID $17.75

Cleveland Asphalt Products Inc. - Shepherd;
TX

100 Asphalt Lane

Cationic Emulsion $40.00 NO BID NO BID

1

Conners Crushed Stone - Groesbeck, TX

(Honest Ridge)

862 CR 374

Flex Base,'3/4 IVlinus, 1" Dry
Screened, 1x3 rock, 3x5 rock, 1"

Base

$11.20 NO BID $10.50

1

Conners Crushed Stone - Clifton, TX

(Greenewade Quarry)

173 CR 1090

Flex Base, 3x5 rock $13.90 NO BID $13.50

1

Helmcamp Materials, LTD.- Groesbeck, TX

(Christmas Quarry)

478 CR 374

2"-Flex Base, Flex Base, 1x3,3x5,

and Larger
$11.10 NO BID $10.50

«

Knife;River - Bryan, TX

6310 Hwy 21 West-'
Plant Mixed Asphalt -Hot Mix, Hot

Mix Cold.Laid, Flex Base
$40.00 NO BID NO BID

1

Knife River - Wacp, TX

3423 Marlln Hwv6

Plant Mixed Asphalt-Hot Mix, Hot -

Mix Cold Laid
$15.00 NO BID $13.25

j

Knife River - Groesbeck, TX

(Sky High Quarry)
3812 FM 1633 West

Flex Base, RIpRap 1x3,3x5,4x8 &

larger
$11.10 NO BID $10.50

1

Martin Marietta - Corsicana, TX

5100 S. HWY 287

Flex Base, Type C, Type D, Dirty

Rock 1",
$6.10 NO BID $7.50



NAVARRO COUNTY

BID NO. 2022-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

Vendor Material Hauling Rate per Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct Hauling Rate per Precinct
Plant Location Pet 2 Pet 2 Pet,2

Mine Services - Waco, TX

1953 Tom Ledbetter Rd

Nontested Flex Base, C Rock 3/4"

Nontested, D/F.BIend 3/8"-l/2"

Nop Tested, 3/8 Pea Gravel,

Torpedo Rock

$14.95 NO BID $13.25

•  • • • 1

Rattler Rock - Blum, TX

110 HCR1104 LP

Flexbase, 3" - 5" Screened Rock, 1"-
3" screened rock, Non tested Blue

Base

Si3.90 NO BID $13.80

- . 1

Sustainable Pavement - Dallas, TX

11143 Goodnight Lane

Green Oil Sand, Super,RAM (Asphalt

Millings}, Type D Green Gold Mix,

ReCap(High Performance Cold

Patch)

$14.55 NO BID $17.75

-  . ■ 1

Texas Bit - Malakpff Plant

10615 GRRd,1220
Hot Oil Sand, Hox Mix, Cold Mix $7.00 NO-BID $11.50

■

Waller County Asphalt - Hempstead TX
22010 Fairgrounds Rd.

ASPPM GR IV High Performance,

Bagged Material, ASPPM GRIV

High Performance Cold Mix -9202

Asphaltic Concrete Patching-

Material

$40.00 NO BID NO BID

ftOFTRUCKS - MIN/MAX- ' ft OFTRUCKS - MIN/MAX- # OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX-

QTV/rONARUCK qtyaonaruck QTYAONARUCK

UNLIMITED NO BID UNUMITED

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

DEUVERYTIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY: NONE

MAX,DELIVERY: NONE

LIMITAITONS ON DELIVERY: NONE

NO BID DEUVERYTIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY: 12 TONS

MAXDEUVERY: 26 TONS

LIMITATIONS NOT SPECIFIED

/  -

PCf 2r$6;00PERT6N

PCT2-$85.00 PER HR

PCT2-.18L0ADED.MILE

NO BID PRECINCT 2 ■ $100.00 PER HR



NAVARRO COUNTY

BID NO. 2022-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

BM Logistics

508 N Kerr

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

903-875-9228

BM Logistics

508 N Kerr

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

903-875-9228

Havoc Transportation

P.O. Box 57

Blooming Grove, TX

76626

Jason Drain/Owner

903-257-5365

Havoc Transportation

P.O. Box 57

Blooming Grove, TX

76626

Jason Drain/Owner

903-257-5365

Tommy Montgomery

Sand & Grave!

1000 FM 667

Purdon,TX 76679

Tommy Montgomery

903-875-8194

Tommy Montgomery

Sand & Gravel

1000 FM 667

Purdon, TX 76679

Tommy Montgomery

903-875-8194

Vendor Material

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct
Plant Location Pet 3 ■-Richland . Pet 3 - Dawson Pet 3-Richland Pet 3 - Dawson Pet 3-Richland Pet 3 - Dawson

Arnold Crushed Stone-Blum TX
1676 HCR 1104 LP

Flex Base, Torpedo Rock, Fines, #57
Rock, 3x5 Oversize, 4x8 Gabion,
8x12 RioRao 8i larger.

NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID S13.75 $9.75

Big City Crushed Concrete - Dallas, TX
11143 Goodnight Lane

Crushed Concrete 247 FlexBase, D
Grade 1-2, Crushed Asphalt .

NO BID NO BID . NO BID NO BID $17.75

]

$18.00,

Cleveland Asphalt Products Inc. - Shepherd,
TX

ICQ Asphalt Lane
Cationic Emulsion NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1

NOBID

Conners Crushed Stone - Groesbeck, TX
(Honest Ridge)
862 CR 374

Flex Base, 3/4 Minus, 1" Dry
Screened, 1x3 rock, 3x5 rock, 1"
Base

NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID $8.00

1  1

$8.50

Conners Crushed Stone - Clifton, TX
(Greenewade Quarry)
173 CR 1090

Flex Base, 3x5 rock NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.25

j

$9.75

Helmcamp Materials, LTD - Groesbeck, TX
(Christmas Quarry)
478 CR 374

2" Flex Base, Flex Base, 1x3,3x5,
and Larger NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID_ $8.00

1

$8.50

Knife River - Bryan, TX
6310 Hwy 21 West

Plant Mixed Asphalt -Hot Mix, Hot
Mix Cold Laid, Flex Base

NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID

1

NO BID.

Knife River - Waco, TX
3423 Marlin Hwy 6

Plant Mixed Asphalt -Hot Mix, Hot
Mix Cold Laid

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.25 $9.75
-  . . - - .. . . - • • -  . 1

Knife River - Groesbeck, TX
(Sky High Quarry)
3812 FM 1633 West

Flex Base, RipRap 1x3, 3x5,4x8 &
larger NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID $8.00 $8.50

Martin Marietta - Corsicana, TX
5100 S. HWY 287

Flex Base, Type C, Type D, Dirty
Rock 1".

NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID $7.50 $8.50



NAVARRO COUNTY

BID NO. 2022-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

Vendor Material

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Prednct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct
Plant Location ■,,Pct3-Richland Pet 3 - Dawson Pet 3-Richland Pet 3 - Dav/son Pet 3-Richland Pet 3 - Dawson

Mine Services - Waco, TX
1953 Tort) Ledbetter Rd

Nontested Flex Base, C Rock 3/4"
Nontested, D/F Blend 3/8"-l/2"
Non Tested, 3/8 Pea Gravel,
Torpedo Rock

NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID S13.75 $9.75

Rattler Rock - Blum, TX
110 NCR 1104 LP

Flexbase, 3" - 5":Screened Rock, 1"-
3" screened rock, Non tested Blue
Base

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.75

•  - . - • 1

$9.75

Sustainable Pavement - Dallas, TX
11143 Goodnight Lane

Green Oil Sand; Super RAM(Asphalt
Millings), Type D Green Cold Mix,
ReCap{High Performance Cold
Patch)

NO BID. NO BID NOBID NO BID $17.75 $18.00

Texas Bit - Malakoff Plant

10615 CR Rd 1220
Hot Oil Sand, Hox Mix, Cold Mix NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID $12.00 $13.00

Waller County Asphalt - Hempstead TX
22010 Fairgrounds Rd.

ASPPM GR IV High Performance,
Bagged Material, ASPPM GR IV
High Performance Cold Mix -9202
Asphaltic Concrete Patching
Material

NO BIO NO BID NO BID NOBID _ NOBID NOBID

# OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX- # OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX-
1

# OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX- # OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX #OFTRUCKS - MIN/MAX- S OF TRUCKS - MIn/mAX-
QTY/rON/TRUCK QTYAON/TRUCK QTY/TONARUCK • •  qtv/fonaruck QTY/TON/TRUCK QTYAON/FRUCK

NOBID NQBlp^ . NOBID NOBID UNLIMITED •  UNLIMITED
ADDITIONAL,COMMENTS . ADDITIONAL COMMENTS • ADDITIONAL COMMENTS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 'ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

NO BID NOBID •  NO BID NOBID DELIVERYTIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY: 12 TONS

MAXDEUVERY: 26 TONS
LIMITATIONS NOT SPECIFIED

DELIVERYTIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY: 12 TONS

MAX DEUVERY: 26TONS^
LIMITATIONS NOT SPECIFIED

NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID PRECINCT 3 r $100.00 PER HR PRECINa 3-$100.00 PER HR



NAVARRO'COUNTY

BID NO. 2022-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

■

\

-

BM Logistics

508 N Kerr

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

903-875-9228

Havoc Transportation

P.O. Box 57

Blooming Grove, TX 76626

Jason Drain/Owner

903-257-5365

Tommy Montgomery

Sand & Gravel

1000 FM 667

Purdon,TX 76679

Tommy Montgomery

903-875-8194

Vendor Material

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling'Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct
Plant Location •Pct4 Pet 4 Pet 4

Arnold Crushed Stone-Blum TX

1676 NCR 1104 LP

Flex Base, Torpedo Rock, Fines, #57

Rock, 3x5 Oversize, 4x8 Gabion,

8x12 RIpRap & larger.

$9.55 $9.25 $9.75

Big City Crushed Concrete - Dallas, TX

11143 Goodnight Lane

Crushed Concrete 247 FiexBase, D
Grade 1-2, Crushed Asphalt

$12.55 $13.00 $18.00

Cleveland Asphalt'Products Inc. - Shepherd,

TX .

100 Asphalt Lane

Cationic Emulsion $40.00 $40.00 NO BID

-

Conners Crushed Stone - Groesbeck, TX

(Honest Ridge)

862 CR'374

Flex Base, 3/4 Minus, 1" Dry

Screened, 1x3 rock, 3x5 rock, 1"

Base

$9.00 $8.40 $9.50

Conners Crushed Stone - Clifton, TX

(Greenewade Quarry)

173 CR 1090

Flex Base, 3x5 rock $9.55 $9.25 $9.75

Helmcamp Materials, LTD - Groesbeck, TX

(Christmas Quarry)

478 CR 374

2" Flex Base, Flex Base, 1x3, 3x5,

and Larger
$8.45 S8.40 $9.50

Knife River - Bryan, TX

6310 Hwy 21 West

Plant Mixed Asphalt -Hot Mix, Hot

Mix Cold Laid, Flex Base
$40.00 $40.00 NO BID

Knife River - Waco, TX

3423 Marlin Hwy 6

PlanfMixed Asphalt -Hot Mix, Hot

Mix Cold Laid
$13.00 $13.00 $9.75

Knife River - Groesbeck, TX

(Sky High Quarry)

3812 FM 1633 West •

Flex Base, RipRap 1x3, 3x5,4x8 &

larger
$8.45

s

$8.30 $9.50

Martin Marietta - Corsicana, TX

5100 S. HWY 287

Flex Base, Type C, Type D, Dirty

Rock 1",
$6.10 $6.50 $9.00



NAVARRO COUNTY

BID NO. 2022-H-005 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HAULING OF AGGREGATE

SPECIFICATIONS/BID PROPOSAL FORM

Vendor Material

Hauling Rate

per Precinct •

Hauling Rate

per Precinct

Hauling Rate

per Precinct
Plant Location Pct4 •Pet 4 Pet 4

Mine Services - Waco, TX

1953 Tom Ledbetter Rd

Nontested Flex Base, C Rock 3/4"

Nontested, D/F Blend 3/8"-l/2"

Non Tested, 3/8 Pea Gravel,

Torpedo Rock

$10.25 $9.50 $9.75

Rattler Rock - Blum, TX

110 NCR 1104 LP

Flexbase, 3" - 5" Screened Rock, 1"-

3" screened rock, Non tested Blue

Base

$9.55 $9.25 $9.75

Sustainable Pavement - Dallas, TX

11143 Goodnight Lane
N

Green Oil Sand, Super RAM(AsphaIt

Millings), Type D Green Cold Mix,

ReCap(High Performance Cold

Patch)

$12.55 $14.00 $18.00

Texas Bit - Malakoff Plant

10615 OR Rd 1220
Hot Oil Sand,'Hox Mix, Cold Mix $9.80 $9.50. $13.75

Waller County Asphalt - Hempstead TX

22010 Fairgrounds Rd.

ASPPM GR IV High Performance,

Bagged Material, ASPPM GR IV

High Performance Cold Mix-9202

Asphaltic Concrete Patching

Material

$40.00 $40.00 NO BID

# OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX- # OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX- « OF TRUCKS - MIN/MAX-

QTY/rON/TRUCK QTY/TON/TRUCK QTY/TON/TRUCK"

UNLIMITED UNLIMITED UNLIMITED

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS ADDITIONAL COMMENTS

DELIVERY TIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY: NONE

MAX DEUVERY: NONE

LIMITATIONS ON DEUVERY: NONE

DEUVERY TIME: ANY

MIN DELIVERY: NONE

MAX DELIVERY: NONE

UMITATIONS ON DELIVERY: NONE

DELIVERY TIME: ANY

MIN DEUVERY: 12 TONS

MAX DEUVERY: 26 TONS

UMITATIONS NOT SPECIFIED

PCT4-S6;00 PER TON

pa 4-$85.00 PERHR

pa4-.18 LOADED MILE

Pa4-S7S.00HR

Pa4 - $6.00 TON (BARN TO JOB)

pa 4 - .18 PER LOADED TON MILE RATE

PRECINa4 - $100.00 PER HR


